
11/14/2021  12:00:50AM TO 11/20/2021  11:59:50PM

TN0330100

1701 Broad St21-122145 11/14/2021  12:12:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 11/14/2021  at 00:30 hours, Officer J. Niver (73511) reported a memo at 1701  Broad St. Upon arrival, Police responded to 
apartment 413 and made contact with the complainant, Ms. Deborah Gillis (W/F ). Ms. Gillis stated the neighbors 
above her had been making excessive noise for the past 30 minutes and wanted Police to ask them to quiet down. Police heard 
some noise from the upstairs neighbors but did not find the noise to be excessive. Police responded to apartment 513 and 
attempted to make contact with the residents, but no parties answered to door. Additionally, Police did not hear any noise from 
apartment 513 that could be heard from the hallway. Ms. Gillis just wanted the incident documented, nothing further.

616 Shannon Ave21-122256 11/14/2021  11:20:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 11/14/2021  at 11:28 hours, Officer C. Darling reported a memo at 616 Shannon Ave. Jayla Robinson called and stated that a 
disorder was occurring at this location with a party by the name of Dequan Lewis. I arrived at the address and spoke with a male 
who stated that he was sleeping and nothing was going on here. I had dispatch attempt to call Jayla Robinson and they had no 
luck of reaching her. No disorder was located. No further

 
 

7707 Nautical Way21-122304 11/14/2021   3:00:00AM 290 Vandalism

On 11/14/2021  at 14:05 hours, Officer Waltero (79887) responded to a Vandalism at 7707 Nautical Way. 

I spoke to Delicia House over the phone, who stated someone keyed the rear driver side of her vehicle. Ms. House stated it was 
an "X" mark near the gas tank. Ms. House stated she is not sure where it occurred but it had to happen between 0300 - 1230 
hours on 11/14/2021, no further info at this time.

 
 

 
 

 
 



11/14/2021  12:00:50AM TO 11/20/2021  11:59:50PM

 

7408 Bonny Oaks Dr21-122357 11/14/2021   4:30:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 11/14/2021  at 16:30 hours, Officer Harry Horton (68401) reported a memo at 7408 Bonny Oaks Dr. While on patrol Police 
observed a vehicle stopped in the merge lane at 7400 Bonny Oaks.  Police ran tag  and confirmed the vehicle was not 
stolen. Police spoke to Mr. John Shull who stated the vehicle had broke down.  Police contacted a district owner request wrecker 
service.  Info channel provided S&H towing.  Police stayed on scene until S&H towing arrived on scene.

4758 Highway 5821-122363 11/14/2021   4:00:00PM 23C Shoplifting

On 11/14/2021  at 17:30 hours, Officer S Martin (78348) responded to a Shoplifting at Dollar Tree, 4758 Highway 58.  I spoke with 
employees, Janet Brown and Michelle Harris, and learned the following information.  Three suspects - 2 white females and 1 
white male - concealed merchandise in a bag.  Employees were informed of the concealment by another customer.  Ms. Harris 
confronted the suspects and recovered some of the merchandise.  Ms. Harris believed that the suspects still had some 
merchandise concealed on their persons.  Ms. Harris captured a picture of the suspects' vehicle, a black Ford Escape with no 
registration displayed.  A picture of the suspect vehicle is attached.  The white male suspect was described as follows:  tall, 
thin-build, tattoos on arms and neck.  There was no security camera footage of this incident.  No further.

1426 Meadow Lark Ln21-122366 11/14/2021   4:13:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 11/14/2021  at 17:12 hours, Officer Sherrill (86063) responded to suspicious activity at 1426 Meadow Lark Ln. I spoke with an 
anonymous RP who claimed he heard an explosion and saw a plume of smoke rising from the backyard of the above address. I 
responded to the address and looked around the address with the owner's consent. I noticed no sign of an explosion.

3550 Cummings Hwy21-122402 11/14/2021   6:30:00PM 23C Shoplifting

On 11/14/2021  at 19:05 hours, Officer Joshua Price (76315) and PO O'Connell (87263) responded to a theft from 3550 
Cummings Hwy.

While en route to this location, units were notified that the suspect is possibly still on scene in the back of the parking lot near the 
gas station in a Subaru with an hatchback with Kansas tag as follows: . 

Upon Police arrival, Police checked the area for the suspect and the alleged suspects vehicle. After looking around the parking lot
and other places near Wal Mart, Police were unable to locate the vehicle. Police made contact with the RP, Ms. Hernandez and 
stated the suspect is a white male with a gray cut off shirt with blue jeans. She stated this suspect is possibly D'Artangan Guess. 
The suspect stole 3 vehicle wiring harnesses for his stereo. 

Nothing further at this time.

2100 Hamilton Place Blvd21-122416 11/14/2021   7:56:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 11/14/2021  at 20:27 hours, Officer S. Long (79892) reported a memo at 2100 Hamilton Place Blvd. Police responded to a call 
in which Ms. Amy Ellis informed dispatch she wished to confess to a crime to police. Upon arrival, I spoke with Ms. Ellis who 
stated she is trying to confess to a crime that a Mr. Tevin Bernard had been arrested for. Ms. Ellis appeared as if she might be 
trying to take the blame for a crime that her exboyfriend did so he doesn't go to jail. I notified Inv Blackburn about this and this will 
be followed up on. No further.



11/14/2021  12:00:50AM TO 11/20/2021  11:59:50PM

5764 Hwy 15321-122439 11/14/2021   9:25:00PM 91Z Field Interview

On 11/14/2021  at 21:25 hours, Officer C. Frerichs (86048) reported a memo at 5764 Hwy 153. While on routine patrol, police 
observed a vehicle in the parking lot of the aforementioned location which appeared to have been lived in. The vehicle did not 
have a plate so police initiated a consensual encounter with the occupant, Dismond Allen. Mr. Allen allowed police access to the 
VIN on the vehicle. Mr. Allen has a no-extradition warrant out of Georgia. No further.

5505 Brainerd Rd21-122445 11/14/2021   9:40:00PM 91Z Damaged Property Accidental

On 11/14/2021  at 21:50 hours, Officer Fincher (84846) responded to a Damaged Property Accidental at 5505 Brainerd Rd. Police 
made contact wit Lakila Eddins who stated a Bobby Martin broke a door ($500) on the Motel 6 property with his wheel chair. Ms. 
Eddins stated she does not believe Mr. Martin intentionally broke the door. Ms. Eddins stated Mr. Martin is no longer welcome at 
the Motel 6 and needs to leave. Mr. Martin denied breaking the door. Mr. Martin left the Motel 6 property and he was trespassed 
from this location.

4507 Hixson Pike21-122469 11/14/2021  11:00:00PM 91Z Field Interview

On 11/14/2021  at 23:00 hours, I, Officer Madison #1118 attempted to initiate a traffic stop in the 4900 block of Hixson Pike. The 
vehicle to which I displayed the blue lights of my patrol vehicle was a black 2002 Honda Accord with a TN  (which did 
not come back per dispatch). The vehicle slowed in pace, however continued southbound until reaching a parking lot at 4507 
Hixson Pk. I made contact with the driver, Charles Toney, who stated that he had recently purchased the vehicle and he was 
working on having the registration fixed. I ran the VIN of the vehicle and it did not come back stolen. I also asked Charles Toney 
about his reasoning for which he did not stop earlier, and he stated he was looking for a better lit area. I then issued Charles 
Toney a verbal warning and left the scene. No further.

1330 E 3rd St21-122499 11/15/2021   3:55:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 11/15/2021  at 03:58 hours, Officer Adam Krystaponis (75508) and PO R Johnson responded to a disorder at 1330 E 3rd St. 
Upon arrival, I spoke with Ms. Thrush who informed me that the person on pump 11  is not leaving and had been sleeping in his 
car. Ms. Thrush stated that she called because she was the only one working at the time and it made her uncomfortable.
The person on pump 11  came in and paid for gas informing police that Ms. Thrush said the Speedway would be closed until 4AM. 
So he went to his car smoked a cigarette and took a nap waiting due to his car being on empty.
No evidence of any disorder was located and Ms. Thrush said she did not need Police for anything further.

3641 Cummings Hwy21-122522 11/15/2021  12:01:00AM 290 Vandalism

On 11/15/2021  at 06:50 hours, PT C. Glenn (60757) responded by telephone to a Vandalism at Clarion Inn at 3641  Cummings 
Hwy.  I spoke with Sheryl Heiskell who says that both rear tires of her Nissan Rouge have been cut.  She says she does not know
the cost to replace the tires at this time  She handed her phone to Michael Tuders, her friend.  He says the right rear tire of his 
Chevrolet Colorado was cut.  He says that he does not know the cost to replace the tire.  Mr. Tuders says he will have the motel 
check their security video to see if this shows up and will call to have PD view the video if it will help to ID the suspect.

Nothing further.

5764 153 Hwy21-122545 11/14/2021   3:30:00PM 250 Counterfeiting/Forgery

On 11/15/2021  at 07:28 hours, PT C. Glenn (60757) responded by telephone to a Counterfeiting/Forgery at 5764 153 Hwy.   Mr. 
Eck says at 1530 yesterday, he checked out at Walmart and received a $20.00 bill from the cashier.  He says this morning, he 
went to the circle K on Middle Valley Rd. at Boy Scout Rd. to purchase coffee.  He says he paid with the $20.00 bill and the 
cashier there told him the bill is counterfeit and kept it to give to police.  He says he is out $20.00 as a result.  The CAD card was 
returned  to CPD dispatch per Sgt. Lopez, for an officer to respond to get the counterfeit bill to take to property.

7641 Austin Dr21-122566 11/15/2021   9:39:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information



11/14/2021  12:00:50AM TO 11/20/2021  11:59:50PM

On 11/15/2021  at 09:39 hours, Officer Ricky Ballard (60157) reported a memo at 7641  Austin Dr. Upon arrival, I spoke with the 
RP Emerald House. Ms. House reported her mother, Tammy Gasaway had put her out the house and she need police to stand by
while she gather her personal belongings. Ms. House collected her items and left without incident. No further police assistance 
was needed.

712 Dartmouth St21-122582 11/14/2021   5:30:00PM 23F Theft from Motor Vehicle

On 11/15/2021  at 10:32 hours,  PT McMahan (61444) responded to a Theft from Motor Vehicle by calling the victim at home at 
712 Dartmouth St.  I spoke to the victim over the phone who said that he last saw his vehicle there about 5:30 pm yesterday and 
he's not sure if it was locked.  When he got back to the vehicle around 8 am this morning, he discovered that it had been entered 
and his wife's sunglass collection was gone.  Also, he said the inside had been ransacked but there was no damage and he didn't
see or hear anything last night.  He said his neighbor's camera caught a suspicious vehicle cruising by her house last night but 
she is a couple houses down from him.

4711 Brainerd Rd21-122585 11/15/2021  10:00:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 11/15/2021  at 11:00 hours, Officer Frazier (68396) reported a memo at 4711  Brainerd Rd. The caller called in stating that a 
male was panhandling in the parking lot. Police made contact with Antonio Birt, bought him some coffee, and asked him to leave 
the premises. He did. No further.

22 Starview Ln21-122626 11/15/2021  12:01:00AM 23F Theft from Motor Vehicle

On 11/15/2021  at 12:51  hours, PT C. Glenn (60757) responded by telephone to a Theft from Motor Vehicle at 22 Starview Ln.  Mr. 
Quiles Hernandez says sometime after midnight, an unknown party used a slim jim to gain entry to his 2004 Chevrolet Suburban.  
He says the inside was rummaged through and the center console broken and plastic on the broken.  he says he had three things
stolen from his vehicle and the drive out tag was taken from his girlfriend's 2022 Honda Civic.

4119 13th Ave21-122630 11/15/2021   1:05:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 11/15/2021  at 13:15 hours, Officer Sanchez (73514) reported a memo at 4119 13th Ave. Police were dispatched to the area 
regarding a suspicious white truck parked behind a house. Upon arrival police located the truck (a white Ford F350 with GA tag 

) parked behind a shed on the property. A male identified as Damon Payne ), was near the truck. 
Damon explained that he lives with his mother at the neighboring house and has been parking his truck at this location for some 
time. He did not realize that this part of the property does not belong to his mother. He stated that he would move it right away. 
There is nothing further.

4143 Willard Dr21-122640 11/15/2021   1:38:00PM 23F Theft from Motor Vehicle

On 11/15/2021  at 13:35 hours, PT C. Glenn (60757) responded by telephone to a Theft from Motor Vehicle at 4143 Willard Dr.   
Ms. Bell says that she just noticed that an unknown party has stolen her Ruger 9mm out of her car.  She says she does not know 
when it was taken nor where she was when it was taken.  She says she will have to call where she bought the firearm to get the 
information on it and call back once she has it.

7950 E Brainerd Rd21-122641 11/15/2021   1:30:00PM 91Z Property Found

On 11/15/2021  at 13:50 hours, Officer Harry Horton (68401) responded to a Property Found at 7950 E Brainerd Rd. Upon arrival 
Police spoke to the complainant Mr. Brian Kepper.  Mr Kepper stated while on his way to work he found someone's blue capital 
one credit card on Julian road approximately 100 yards from Thelmeta Ave.  Police collected the credit card that had the name of 
Joseph Hoffamn written on it and turned it over to property.



11/14/2021  12:00:50AM TO 11/20/2021  11:59:50PM

3806 Amnicola Hwy21-122661 11/15/2021   2:15:00PM 23F Theft from Motor Vehicle

On 11/15/2021  at 14:20 hours, Officer D. Boochie (71995) responded to a Theft from Motor Vehicle at 3806 Amnicola Hwy. 

On the above date and time, the Chattanooga Police Department's Teleserve Division received a call in reference to a stolen 
backpack leaf blower from complainant Mark Crawley. Mark Crawley reported he placed his Stihl Backpack Leaf Blower near the 
back of his trailer in order to get to his lawnmower so he could mow the grass at the business of Solid Rock located at 3806 
Amnicola Highway. When Mark Crawley finished mowing, he returned to his trailer to get his blower. It was at this time Mark 
Crawley noticed his backpack blower was stolen. There are no cameras to his knowledge at this location and there is no suspect 
information.

22 Starview Ln21-122673 11/15/2021  12:01:00AM 23F Theft from Motor Vehicle

On 11/15/2021  at 15:11  hours, PT C. Glenn (60757) responded by telephone to a Theft from Motor Vehicle at 22 Starview Ln.   
Ms. Foster says sometime after midnight and before 0600 this morning, an unknown party stole the drive out tag from her 21022 
Honda Civic.

7421 Commons Blvd21-122680 11/15/2021   3:38:00PM 26A False Pretenses/Swindle/Confidenc

On 11/16/2021  at 15:38 hours, Officer Blumenberg (61430) wrote a continuation/supplement for a False 
Pretenses/Swindle/Confidence Game at 7421  Commons Blvd.  Police spoke with Mr. Eggleston via telephone.  He was able to 
find out through Best Buy that a person came into their store at 2290 Gunbarrel Rd, used a TN ID, and then tried to purchase 
electronics at 1204hrs, 1205hrs, and 1211hrs on 11/03/21.  All were declined and the amount was for $873.99.  The employee 
that helped had an ID # of .  He could not get any more information on the employee, but the information that he did 
obtain was very helpful for the prosecution of the suspect.  Nothing further.

 

 
.

 
 

 

 
 

700 Interstate 75 Sb21-122743 11/15/2021   6:05:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 11/15/2021  at 18:10 hours, Officer S. Prinzo (86058) responded to a disorder at 700 Interstate 75 Sb. Officers called Mr. 
Michael Landers who stated he was in heavy traffic while on Interstate 75 Sb when he changed lanes and the vehicle behind him 
came very close to hitting his rear bumper. Mr. Landers stated the driver of the vehicle came up beside him displayed a firearm. 
Officers asked Mr. Landers if he feared the suspect would use the firearm on him. Mr. Landers stated he was not afraid the 
suspect would harm him. Mr. Landers stated he only wanted to let police know the incident occurred. No further.



11/14/2021  12:00:50AM TO 11/20/2021  11:59:50PM

2100 Hamilton Place Blvd21-122758 11/15/2021   7:00:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 11/15/2021  at 19:12 hours, Officer S. Prinzo (86058) responded to suspicious activity at 2100 Hamilton Place Blvd. Officers 
called Mrs. Angel Chong who stated she was leaving the mall when a black male approached her stating he had a job for her. 
Mrs. Chong stated she did not talk to the male party. Mrs. Chong stated she then was approached by a female in a black van 
asking her to get in her vehicle. Mrs. Chong felt as if these parties were working together to abduct young women. Mrs. Chong 
stated she just wanted to make a report of this incident. No further.

400 N Market St21-122764 11/15/2021   7:20:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 11/15/2021  at 19:26 hours, Officer Sydney Hamon (83685) reported a memo at 400 N Market St. An employee of Publix called 
Police to come out and check on a male party outside the store who had been yelling profanities in the store and causing 
customers distress. I made contact with this party and found him to be Christopher Hampton. Hampton appeared to be intoxicated
and was not making sense when he spoke. Eventually I was able to get an address of a home he lived at and transported him 
there. The address was a home on Wilson St. 

No further.

812 E 10th St21-122776 11/15/2021   7:54:00PM 91Z Suspicious Activity

On 11/15/2021  at 19:57 hours, Officer Pierre (84860) reported suspicious activity at 812 E 10th St. Upon arrival on scene police 
met and spoke with Allie Hannah who lives at this address. Ms. Hannah stated that she was home alone and she heard what 
sounded like foot steps on her back porch. Ms. Hannah stated that she became scared and called some of her friends to come 
over. Ms. Hannah stated that when her friends came over, they looked out on the back porch and saw that the porch closet door 
was open, and it usually isn't. Ms. Hannah also stated that there was a shirt hanging over the hand rail that did not belong to her 
or her roommates. Ms. Hannah's residence was placed on the watch list for the next 2 weeks. Nothing further at this time.

4513 Hixson Pike21-122809 11/15/2021  10:25:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 11/15/2021  at 22:26 hours, Officer Luke Nelson (79533) reported a memo at 4513 Hixson Pike. Police received notice from 
the property owner that a homeless party was sleeping on their property and requested police move them along. I made contact 
with Cornelius Heard who appeared to be sleeping in the breezeway and requested he move along. Nothing further.

N Lyerly//E 3rd St21-122826 11/15/2021  11:41:00PM 91Z Field Interview

On 11/15/2021  at 23:42 hours, Officer Adam Krystaponis (75508) and PO R Johnson (87257) initiated a traffic stop at N Lyerly 
and E 3rd Street. 
While on routine patrol I noticed a black two-door vehicle traveling down E 3rd street without lights turned on for the vehicle.

I initiated the stop and spoke with the driver of the vehicle, Mr. Belle, who stated that his lights were on. I informed him that the 
rear lights were not operating when I spotted him.

While conducting the stop I learned that Mr. Belle is a convicted felon so I asked him if he had any weapons inside the vehicle. 
Mr. Belle stated he knew that I was going to asked that and said he did not have any weapons and that I could search his vehicle.
After patting down Mr. Belle, I searched his vehicle and did not locate anything in it.

Before Mr. Belle left I checked his lights and both the front headlights and brakelight were operational. Mr. Belle did however have
both taillights out which I wrote him a voucher for.
At this time, there is nothing further.

1949 Northpoint Blvd21-122838 11/16/2021   1:11:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information



11/14/2021  12:00:50AM TO 11/20/2021  11:59:50PM

On 11/16/2021  at 01:15 hours, Officer Adams (66965) responded to 1949 Northpoint Blvd on a suspicious activty. Upon arrvial 
police searched area and did not observe any suspicious activity.

Mccallie Ave//Derby St21-122842 11/15/2021  12:40:00AM 91Z Field Interview

On 11/15/2021  at 00:56 hours, Officer Adam Krystaponis (75508) and PO R Johnson (87257) responded to a broke down auto at 
Mccallie Ave / Derby St. 

While on routine patrol, I noticed two young women attempting to change a tire with very little success. When I got out with them I 
spoke with Ms. Mcneely who stated she was on her way to get hushpuppies from the cook out when she noticed her vehicle 
driving funny so she pulled off onto Derby Street and discovered that she had a flat tire. Ms. Mcneely stated that she called her 
friend Ms. Wooldridge to come assist her with the flat.

Ms. Mcneely stated she didn’t even know she had a spare and that it took at least 10 minutes of you tubing to figure out where he
spare was located and how to remove it from the vehicle.

After changing the tire, I stuck around while Ms. Mcneely aired up the spare. The two women then left together and left Ms. 
Mcneelys vehicle parked on Derby.

After running the tag it was learned that the tag goes to a Nissan while the vehicle that it is one is a Mazda Suv. It is unclear if the 
driver of the vehicle knows this or not.

Nothing further.

 
 

 
 

 
 

 

 
 

 
 

 

 
 

 
 
 



11/14/2021  12:00:50AM TO 11/20/2021  11:59:50PM

4355 Hwy 5821-122872 11/16/2021   6:00:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 11/16/2021  at 06:05 hours, Officer Galante (83683) responded to the Speedway at 4355 Hwy 58. 
Complainant, Mr. Solis requested a Police report regarding the alleged sighting of a particular part (Gregory Malone) said to be 
trespassed from the Speedway. That party was not located in Speedway property nor in the surrounding area.

Nothing further.

2540 6th Ave21-122879 11/16/2021   6:28:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 11/16/2021  at 06:33 hours, Officer B ALLEN (65118) reported a memo at 2540 6th Ave. 
Police were dispatched to a possible disorder at the aforementioned address. Police arrived on the scene trying to make contact 
with the RP ( Jasmine) but she never showed up. According to dispatch, Jasmine stated that a woman by name of  Alexis got into 
an argument with her and pulled a knife out threatening her.  Jasmine stated that Alexis was still in the home at 2540 6th Ave. 
Police check the address and made contact with Ms. Vaniesia Martin that stated no one by either of those names stay at that 
address or has been to that address. Police made several attempts to try and contact Jasmine but were unsuccessful. No further 
police action is needed at this time.

2119 E 23rd St21-122880 11/16/2021   6:34:00AM 91Z Field Interview

On 11/16/2021  at 06:37 hours, Officer Slater (84863) reported a memo at 2119 E 23rd St. Police responded out to the above 
address on an unconscious party. Once on scene police observed this party to be only sleeping. Once this party was awake, 
police identified this female as a Ms. Tonya Ector. Ms. Ector was checked for any outstanding warrants. None which were active 
at this time. Ms. Ector left the area without incident. Nothing further.

18 Tunnel Blvd21-122885 11/16/2021   7:00:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 11/16/2021  at 07:45 hours, Officer Frazier (68396) reported a memo at 18 Tunnel Blvd. Upon arrival to the alarm, police 
discovered an open door. Police cleared the apartment and it was cleared. The door was locked upon departure. No further.

3956 Brainerd Rd21-122901 11/16/2021   7:00:00AM 23C Shoplifting

On 11/16/2021  at 08:15 hours, Officer Frazier (68396) responded to a Shoplifting at 3956 Brainerd Rd. Upon arrival, police spoke 
with Speedway Manager Ellen Lewis. Ellen stated to police that a suspect (b/m, yellow shirt, black pants) came inside the 
Speedway. Once inside the store, the suspect placed several items inside his backpack. The suspect passed all points of store 
sales without paying for the merchandise and walked away from the scene. Police checked behind ABC Liquor and down 
Brainerd Road but were unable to locate the suspect. At this time, police will keep an eye out for the violator.

490 Greenway View Dr21-122903 11/15/2021   7:15:00AM 91Z Damaged Property Accidental

On 11/16/2021  at 08:07 hours,  PT McMahan (61444) responded to a Damaged Property Accidental by calling the victim at 490 
Greenway View Dr  (Walmart).  I spoke to the victim over the phone who said that her car was damaged while it was parked there
yesterday morning.  She left it parked when she got there around 7:15 am and when she left around 8:30 am, she discovered 
damage on the driver side rear corner, which consisted mostly of a big dent.   She checked with Walmart on cameras and she 
found out that her vehicle was not in camera view.  She believes another vehicle may have caused the damage but there is no 
proof of how the damage was done or if it was intentional.  She said there have been no estimates yet.

412 Georgia Ave21-122921 11/16/2021   9:09:00AM 91Z Property Lost



11/14/2021  12:00:50AM TO 11/20/2021  11:59:50PM

On 11/16/2021  at 09:22 hours, Officer D. Boochie (71995) responded to a Property Lost at 412 Georgia Ave. 

On the above date and time, the Chattanooga Police Department's Teleserve Division received a call in reference to a lost license
plate reported by Welden Bolin. Welden Bolin stated he was calling in on behalf of one of the drivers for the Zee Company. The 
license plate fell off one of their trucks and could be anywhere between Amnicola Highway and Sale Creek as this is the route the
driver takes for deliveries. The license plate number is  (TN) and was entered into NCIC as *****LOST***** on this day. 
The NIC number is: P517641247.

1825 Gunbarrel Rd21-122922 11/14/2021   1:00:00PM 91Z Damaged Property Accidental

On 11/16/2021  at 09:18 hours,  PT McMahan (61444) responded to a Damaged Property Accidental by calling the victim at 1825 
Gunbarrel Rd at First Watch restaurant.  The victim said her vehicle was damaged while it was parked there this past Sunday.  
She got there around 1 pm and parked her vehicle in the back lot.  When she left there later around 1:45 or 2 pm, she discovered 
damage on the driver side front fender and door consisting mostly of dents and scratches.  She said she talked to the Manager 
there and there are no cameras outside.  She believes another vehicle may have caused the damage but there is no proof of how
the damage was done at this time or if it was intentional.  She said there have been no estimates yet.

On 11/22/2021  at 13:58 hours,  PT McMahan (61444) wrote a continuation/supplement for a Damaged Property Accidental at 
1825 Gunbarrel Rd. The victim said that the damage was actually on the passenger side not the driver side and also the wheel 
had been damaged as well.

2547 Will Kelley Rd21-122934 11/16/2021  10:00:00AM 23H Other Theft/Non-Specific

On 11/16/2021  at 10:16 hours,  PT McMahan (61444) responded to a Other Theft/Non-Specific by calling the victim at home at 
2547 Will Kelley Rd.   The victim said that 2 black males pulled up to his mailbox in a Chevy Tahoe, gray or silver in color.  He saw
them grab some mail out of the box and then they took off down the street.  He said he didn’t get a tag number but he was able to
get all his mail back later after he went down the street and found it laying on the side of the road.  He said the only mail he had in
the box was some Christmas Cards and they apparently threw them out after realizing there was no money in them.  He said the 
driver side front fender was blue on the vehicle and the males appeared to be in their 40’s yoa.  He said this happened right 
before he called us.

 

5952 Brainerd Rd21-122943 11/16/2021  11:03:00AM 23F Theft from Motor Vehicle

On 11/16/2021  at 11:00 hours, Officer C. Darling responded to a Theft from Motor Vehicle at 5952 Brainerd Rd. (Cube Smart) 
Benny Griffin stated that he came to check on his rv and found that the catalytic converter was cut/removed from the vehicle. Mr. 
Griffin also found that his enclosed trailer that was attached to his rv was also broken into. Mr. Griffin stated that a winch, 
motorcycle racks, and ratchet straps were stolen from inside the trailer. Mr. Griffin stated that he will have to call back in with a 
detailed list. Security cameras are on site but no employee was on site to view them at this time. Mr. Griffin stated that this 
occurred probably within the last two weeks. No further

 
 
 

 



11/14/2021  12:00:50AM TO 11/20/2021  11:59:50PM

2702 Glass St21-122986 11/16/2021  12:27:00PM 26A False Pretenses/Swindle/Confidenc

On 11/16/2021  at 12:13 hours, Officer C. Glenn (60757) responded by telephone to a False Pretenses/Swindle/Confidence Game 
at 2702 Glass St.   I spoke with Teresa Bivens.  She says she found in her employee file at her former job at Bright Star Academy 
her unemployment card.  She says she has not filed for unemployment.  She says Kimberly Porter, who operates Bright Star 
owns the property at 2702 Glass St. and has converted it into apartments,  She says contacted the unemployment office and was 
told  unemployment benefits of $15,600 were paid out in her name using the Glass St address   She says the benefits ran from 
06/28/2020 through 05/26/2021.  She says Ms. Porter. told her she did not know anything about the unemployment nor who had 
her information.

7024 Mccutcheon Rd21-123002 11/16/2021   1:30:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 11/16/2021  at 13:40 hours, Officer C. Darling reported a memo at 7024 Mccutcheon Rd. (Super 8) Police were called to 
location to check the status of the parties located in the room of 211. I made contact with Martina Ball who was gathering her 
belongings. All was well at this location and Ms. Ball gathered her belongings and left. No further

1323 Vance Rd21-123007 11/16/2021   1:49:00PM 26B Credit Card/ATM Fraud

On 11/16/2021  at 12:43 hours, PT C. Glenn (60757) responded by telephone to a Credit Card/ATM Fraud at 1323 Vance Rd.  
Mrs. Penny says that on 11/14/2021, two transactions hit her First Bank checking account.  one online purchase from SORT for 
tactical equipment for $500.00.  She says she contacted them and the order has been canceled but the money has still come out 
of her account.  She says it will eventually be returned.  She says the second was an online transactions at Alexia.com for  
$445.20, she says that transaction went through.  She says First Bank is requiring a police report prior to returning any monies to 
her account so she is currently out the total of both charges.

120-139 Highway 153 Nb21-123011 11/16/2021   1:28:00PM 91Z Damaged Property Accidental

On 11/16/2021  at 13:28 hours, Officer Ricky Ballard (60157) responded to a Damaged Property Accidental at 120-139 Highway 
153 Nb. Upon arrival, I spoke to the RP, Dean Poi. Mr. Poi reported he was driving northbound at 139 Highway 153 when an 
object flew off a truck and cracked his vehicle's windshield. The driver of the truck, Ronald Rettinhouse, pulled over and reported 
he was unaware that anything had flown off his truck. Mr. Poi reported he had waved for Mr. Rettinhouse to stop. No one was 
injured. No further information is available at this time.

1944 Northpoint Blvd21-123025 11/16/2021   3:00:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 11/16/2021  at 15:05 hours, Officer E. McCall (0062872) reported a theft at 1944 Northpoint Blvd. Upon arrival, officer McCall 
spoke to Home Depot LP Earlene Deeter. Ms. Deeter said that a frequent shoplifter (Ricky Burns) was in their store. Ms. Deeter 
said that Mr. Burns had multiple items in his backpack and when he saw her he started dumping them. Ms. Deeter said that Mr. 
Burns then fled the scene without the items. Ms. Deeter said their store policy is the suspect has to pass all points of sale for them
to press charges. Ms. Deeter said she just wanted a report made stating that Mr. Burns was back in their store.

4345 Highway 5821-123030 11/16/2021   2:22:00PM 240 MVT/Passenger Vehicle

On 11/16/2021  at 15:20 hours, Officer S. Prinzo (86058) responded to a MVT/Passenger Vehicle at 4345 Highway 58. Once on 
scene, officers spoke with Mr. William Robinson who stated his red Ford Focus was stolen from the Exxon gas station while he 
was inside the store. Mr. Robinson stated he left the keys in the vehicle while he went inside the store. Officers reviewed the video
from the gas station and saw two black males get into the vehicle and leave. Officers could not see any faces from the video. 
Officers entered the vehicle into NCIC on this date (NIC# V013479628) No further.

1400 E Main St21-123045 11/16/2021   3:30:00PM 91Z Field Interview



11/14/2021  12:00:50AM TO 11/20/2021  11:59:50PM

On 11/16/2021  at 15:18 hours, I, Officer Scoggins #841, responded to reports of homeless people scaring off customers from a 
business at 1400 E Main St. Officers made contact with the homeless parties on the lot and they agreed to leave the area. The 
homeless parties are hanging out on the lot just waiting for the Rescue Mission to open. I was told a Maroon van parked on the lo
has not moved in several weeks and was asked by the business owner to ask the owner to move the vehicle. I made contact with 
Delicia Orr inside the vehicle, she stated the vehicle had a dead battery but she would find someone to jump off the vehicle and 
move it to a different location.

 
 

 
 

3469 Brainerd Rd21-123073 11/14/2021   6:00:00PM 23G Theft of Vehicle Parts/Accessories

On 11/19/2021  at 13:59 hours,  PT McMahan (61444) responded to a Theft of Vehicle Parts/Accessories by calling the victim at 
3469 Brainerd Rd at Christy’s Lounge.  I spoke to the victim over the phone who said that he last saw the tag (plate) on his 
vehicle when he got there last Sunday at about 6 pm.  He left the vehicle parked there for a while and then left around 11  pm and 
drove it straight home.  He said he then discovered that the tag was gone while he was at work the next day at Dawn School (901  
Altamont Rd).  He actually discovered it when he got off work around 4 pm.  He did not have the tag# and it had to be found by 
running the VIN in DMV. 

 Tag#    Vehicle Info: 2003 Ford Escape, maroon in color,  VIN/ 1FMCU031X3KD48589

I contacted NCIC and had the tag entered as stolen under Nic# P117659039.

3354 Charger Dr21-123160 11/16/2021   5:00:00PM 23G Theft of Vehicle Parts/Accessories

On 11/16/2021  at 20:30 hours, Officer Wiegand (84865) responded to a Theft of Vehicle Parts/Accessories at 3354 Charger Dr. 
Police spoke with the victim Evon Baird who stated he was at this location for a game between 1700 and 2000. When Mr. Baird 
returned to vehicle #1 Ram 1500 the license plate had been stolen TN  Police entered the license plate as stolen in 
NCIC #P627669602. There is no suspect information at this time.

1500 E 41st St21-123171 11/16/2021   9:15:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 11/16/2021  at approximately 21:20 hours, I, Officer J. Noble #818, responded to1500 East 41st Street (Safebox Self Storage) 
in reference to a suspicious activity call. Upon arrival, I made contact with the complainant, Mark Hartness. Mr. Hartness works at 
the aforementioned location and stated he has been having issues with people getting into the dumpster and taking stuff. 
According to Mr. Hartness, he has had to replace locks on the dumpster numerous times due to the locks being broken off. I 
checked the area and was unable to locate anyone. This business was added to the watch list for two weeks. No further police 
action was required.

104 Halsey St21-123193 11/16/2021  10:15:00PM 91Z Field Interview



11/14/2021  12:00:50AM TO 11/20/2021  11:59:50PM

On 11/16/2021  at 22:35 hours, Officer Ayres (82234) reported a memo at 104 Halsey St.  Upon arrival I spoke with Kenneth 
Dozier.  Mr. Dozier and his wife Tamika Davis, were in a verbal argument over mutual property.  Mr. Dozier was planning to leave 
his residence at the request of his wife Tamika Davis, however they were disagreeing on what property Mr. Dozier would be able 
to leave with at this time.  Since all property belonging to Mr. Dozier and Ms. Davis is mutual property of theirs by marriage, police
were unable to intervene with the sorting out of the property.  Since Mr. Dozier and Ms. Davis were unable to come to an 
agreement, Mr. Dozier decided he was not going to leave the residence.  Both Mr. Dozier or Ms. Davis stated this argument never
became physical.  I did not observe any signs of any physical altercation taking place.  Since both Mr. Dozier and Ms. Davis both 
live at the residence and all property involved is mutual through marriage, no police action was taken.

No further action was taken at this time for this incident.

400 Interstate 75 Sb21-123209 11/16/2021  11:33:00PM 91Z Field Interview

On 11/16/2021  at 23:34 hours, Officer S. Prinzo (86058) made a traffic stop at 400 Interstate 75 Sb. Officers observed a vehicle 
traveling east on shallowford Rd with out any lights on the vehicle. Offices attempted to stop the vehicle. The Mitsubishi Mirage 
with TN ) slow rolled down the ramp once officers initiated blue lights. Once the vehicle stopped officers stepped out 
of the vehicle and attempted to make a passenger side approach. Once officers made it to the back side of the patrol car the 
suspect vehicle began to drive away. Officers did not purse the vehicle at this time. No further.

5751 Brainerd Rd21-123224 11/17/2021   1:01:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On the 17th of November 2021  at 0101, Officer Lynch responded to a disorder at Bud's Sports Bar, 5751  Brainerd Rd.
Upon arrival, I, Officer Lynch, spoke to Stefanie Payne. She told me that she was standing close to the stage when a physical 
altercation broke out amongst some of the patrons. During this altercation, she was punched in the mouth by Donald Stafford. 
Stefanie couldn't definitively say that Mr. Stafford intentionally hit her. Still, she was sure that Mr. Stafford had punched her. 
Stefanie did sustain a busted lip due to the altercation. I then went and spoke to Mr. Stafford, Angela Stafford, and Joshua Block. 
Mr. Stafford wasn't able to provide any insight into what occurred due to his level of intoxication. However, he did tell me that he 
didn't hit anyone and that someone named Eric was coming at him while he was singing, so he defended himself. Angela and 
Joshua told me that this altercation started over a quarter game that Eric and Donald were playing. While Donald was singing a 
song on stage, Eric approached Donald about the game. Joshua went to intervein between Donald and Eric, while Angela tried to 
hold Donald back. But instead, Eric and Donald proceeded to get into a physical altercation with each other. During this time, 
more patrons at the bar attempted to break the parties up, and Stefanie was unfortunately punched in the mouth. The staff 
informed me that Eric, unknown last name, and Donald would be barred from the premises for their actions tonight. No further at 
this time.

 

3416 Rossville Blvd21-123238 11/17/2021   4:32:00AM 91Z Field Interview

On 11/17/2021  at 02:56 hours, Officer M. Recaido #965 was dispatched to 3416 Rossville Blvd. for a report of a suspicious 
person.  Upon arrival, officers met with Mr. Thomas Owens and Mr. Stanley Roe.  After speaking to both parties, the following was
discovered.  Mr. Roe was walking in the parking lot next to Mr. Owens' parking lot.  Mr. Owens heard a noise and went outside to 
investigate.  When he got outside, he saw Mr. Roe walking past his vehicle.  Mr. Owens thought Mr. Roe had been looking 
through his vehicles and confronted him.  Mr. Owens then showed officers video footage.  Around 0000 hours, a white male 
matching Mr. Roe's build but not his clothing.  The male in the footage is seen sneaking around the property while Mr. Owens is 
checking the property.  Around 0230 hours, Mr. Roe can be seen walking in the parking lot next to Mr. Owens' and not entering 
Mr. Owens' property.  No further.

5513 Tn-153 Hwy21-123242 11/17/2021   3:40:00AM 91Z Field Interview



11/14/2021  12:00:50AM TO 11/20/2021  11:59:50PM

On 11/17/2021  at 04:07 hours, Officer M. Braisted (429) and B. Siler (1156) responded to a suspicious vehicle at 5513 TN-153 
Hwy. Upon arrival, officers made contact with Anna Arnold (W/F) sitting in a white Chevrolet Impala (TN ). Ms. Arnold 
said she was waiting to hear back from her boyfriend before heading home to see if he needed a ride. Officers suggested she 
move to Wal-Mart or another business that would allow her to sit in the parking lot. Ms. Arnold was cooperative and agreed to 
move along. No wants/warrants on Ms. Arnold were found. No further.

 
 

.

2420 Williams St21-123269 11/16/2021   8:00:00PM 23G Theft of Vehicle Parts/Accessories

On 11/17/2021  at 07:01  hours, Officer J. Cannon and PO R. Morgan  responded to a Theft of Vehicle Parts at 2420 Williams St, 
Comfort Inn. Upon arrival police spoke with complainant Andy Orozco who said between the hours of 2000 on 11/16/21  and 0630 
hours on 11/17/21  unknown person(s) stole the 2 catalytic converters off the listed Isuzu truck. The vehicle was parked in the 
parking lot on the NW side of the building. The employees at Comfort Inn at the time police were on scene were not able to review
surveillance video. There is no suspect information at this time.

1719 Wilcox Blvd21-123288 11/17/2021   8:16:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 11/17/2021  at 08:20 hours, Officer Silveira (66499) reported a memo at 1719 Wilcox Blvd. Upon arrival, Police spoke with the 
complainant, Ms. Millsap. She reported that got into a verbal altercation with her landlord, Mike Knox while she was leaving the 
residence. Apparently, Knox was very upset, because Millsap had caused some damage inside of his property and she was 
behind with the rent. Mr. Knox stated that he hadn't started the eviction process yet, However Millsap told Police and Knox that 
she was willing to leave the residence and she would come back sometime this week to pick up her washer and dryer. After 
loading some of her belongings, Ms. Millsap left the scene without incident.

2358 Lifestyle Way21-123316 11/17/2021  10:58:00AM 26A False Pretenses/Swindle/Confidenc

On 11/17/2021  at 09:05 hours, Officer Branam (70776) responded to a False Pretenses/Swindle/Confidence Game at 2358 
Lifestyle Way.   The caller, Sharron Buck, stated that she attempted to sale for wedding dress over Facebook.  She stated that a 
buyer used a fake email account that appears as "Venmo" to convince her that money had to be refunded by buying Google gift 
cards.  Ms. Buck stated that she purchased $500 worth of gifts cards and gave them the information.  The suspect used a fake 
Facebook account,a fake Venmo email account, and the shipping address for the original agreement did not verify.  There is  no 
current suspect information at this time.

514 E 17th St21-123346 11/16/2021   2:30:00PM 23G Theft of Vehicle Parts/Accessories

On 11/17/2021  at 10:20 hours, PT C. Glenn (60757) responded by telephone to a Theft of Vehicle Parts/Accessories at 514 E 
17th St.   Mr. Zavala says sometime after 1430 hours yesterday, an unknown party stole TN  from his 2010 Nissan.

NCIC# P127648345.

5506 Miller Dr21-123352 11/17/2021  11:33:00AM 23H Other Theft/Non-Specific



11/14/2021  12:00:50AM TO 11/20/2021  11:59:50PM

On 11/17/2021  at 11:15 hours, Officer Lockhart (66490) responded to a Theft from Building at 5506 Miller Dr. Upon arrival, police 
made contact with Mr. Matthew Ware (w/m, ), who wished to file a report regarding theft of business checks from their 
office. Mr. Ware stated that at least three checks had been taken at an unknown time and had been cashed by an unknown 
person. The total value of these checks was $3,126. As these were business checks, the suspect must have represented 
themselves as an employee of the company. The checks in question were dated 10/19/21  and 10/21/21. Mr. Ware was unable to 
determine what date two of the checks were cashed, but one was cashed on 10/26/21. Mr. Ware further stated the office had 
stopped using the mailbox on site and had switched to a PO Box, so this issue should not occur in the future. 
There is no suspect information available at this time, and Mr. Ware stated the banks were not able to provide any information 
regarding when or where the checks were cashed.

1058 Graysville Rd21-123367 11/16/2021   5:00:00PM 23G Theft of Vehicle Parts/Accessories

On 11/18/2021  at 08:35 hours, PT C. Glenn (60757) wrote a continuation/supplement for a Theft of Vehicle Parts/Accessories at 
1058 Graysville Rd.  Mr. Miller called in to state that he was unaware of another hole in the front fence next to the dumpster.  He 
says that 2 or 3 large truck tires were left on the church's property and thought we should respond to see the tires.  I told him that 
we can add this information without an officer coming out.  He agreed and says he will carry the tires to the recycle place on 
Standifer Gap Rd.

Nothing further.

7604 Standifer Gap Rd21-123372 11/17/2021  11:40:00AM 91Z Field Interview

On 11/17/2021  at 11:46 hours, Officer Layne, Dakota (77578) reported a memo at 7604 Standifer Gap Rd. Police responded to a 
male walking in the roadway, police noticed a male who identified himself as Mr. Butt walking on the side of the road. Due to the 
lack of sidewalks in the area police offered Mr. Butt a ride to the bus stop, while transporting Mr. Butt to the bus stop he stated he 
wanted to get out of the vehicle on commons Blvd. Police stopped the vehicle and allowed Mr. Butt to exit the vehicle. Nothing 
further to report.

825 Runyan Dr21-123396 11/17/2021   1:34:00PM 23G Theft of Vehicle Parts/Accessories

On 11/17/2021  at 13:00 hours, Officer Williams (63838) responded to a Theft of Vehicle Parts/Accessories at 825 Runyan Dr 
(Summit View Retirement Home). Police made contact with the Director of the above location Kendra Coulter. Ms. Coulter stated 
that sometime after April of this year the license plate (TN ) was stolen off from a 2016 Ford Shuttle bus. No suspect 
information could be obtained. Ms. Coulter needs a report to obtain a new license plate. The stolen plate was placed into NCIC 
(NIC# P607695892) as stolen. No further at this time.

1100 Carter St21-123430 11/17/2021   2:00:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 11/17/2021  at 14:08 hours, Officer G. Stroud (75386) reported a memo at 1100 Carter St.  Mr. Raynor contacted Police to 
have Marcel McKinney trespassed from the hotel. McKinney was not located and could not be trespassed. I am fairly confident 
that Marcel McKinney had already been trespassed from this location amongst others but cannot find reports to verify this 
information. I informed Mr. Raynor to contact Police when he sees him again as he stated he shows up several times a week.



11/14/2021  12:00:50AM TO 11/20/2021  11:59:50PM

2711 N Orchard Knob Ave21-123486 11/17/2021   4:22:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 11/17/2021  at 16:28 hours, Officer Michael Ortiz (83692) reported a memo at 2711  N Orchard Knob Ave. Jimmie Gibson called 
police stating that the residence at 2711  N Orchard Knob Ave has a window that has been pushed in as if someone had entered 
the house. This residence is vacant and no one should be on the property. Police were unable to secure the side window. Mr. 
Gibson stated that he will try to keep an eye on the property.

1412 Bailey Ave21-123532 11/17/2021   1:30:00PM 23F Theft from Motor Vehicle

On 11/17/2021  at 18:00 hours, Officer Dropp (675) responded by phone to a Theft from Motor Vehicle at 1412 Bailey Ave. Ms. 
Maria Gonzalez De Rizo stated that while she was at work, some time between 1330 hours and 1730 hours, someone had 
broken into her car and stole her wallet. She stated that she remembers locking her vehicle, but when she returned to it after she 
got off of work she observed that her vehicle had been gone through with the items inside strewn across the interior of the car. 
Maria stated that her Alabama ID, a WynnSouth debit card, her WIC card, $80, an insurance card, and possibly her 1-year-old 
daughter's Social Security Card were all in her wallet. She stated that a neighboring business may have cameras and if there is 
video of the incident, she will call back and have officers respond to the scene to view it. There is no suspect information at this 
time.

 
 

 
 

6121 Lee Hwy21-123589 11/17/2021   8:21:00PM 23C Shoplifting

On 11/17/2021  at 20:23 hours, Officer Montana (84854) responded to a Shoplifting at 6121  Lee Hwy. Upon my arrival, I spoke 
with complainant/manager, Debra Mooney. She stated a party came in with a backpack and mask on , grabbed two cases of beer
and left the store passing all point of sales. She was unable to get a description of the vehicle  but did get the tag TN-  
The tag given does not come up to anything.  She did not know any other discription of the suspect. The beer looked like it was 
one of the bigger cases but not sure what kind it was. Nothing further due to lack of suspect information.

1106 N Hickory St21-123629 11/17/2021  11:28:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 11/17/2021  at 23:29 hours, Officer Park (86057) reported a memo at 1106 N Hickory St. Upon arrival, Police talked to Ms. 
Gloria Sivels. She stated she had been into a verbal disorder with her husband Mr. Anthony Sivels. She stated before poilce 
arriving Mr. Sivels had left the scene. The police searched the area but was unable to locate Mr. Sivels.

2403 Bailey Ave21-123641 11/18/2021  12:48:00AM 23H Other Larceny/Access Device



11/14/2021  12:00:50AM TO 11/20/2021  11:59:50PM

On 11/18/2021  at 00:31  hours, Officer Slater (84863) responded to a Other Larceny/Access Device at 2403 Bailey Ave. Police 
made contact with a Ms. April Crumley who showed police she had un-authorized transactions on her credit card starting on 
11-15-21  for approximately 281.68 dollars. Ms. Crumley informed police that at this time all of the transactions were marked as 
fraud and that all of the money had been charged back to her account. 

After speaking with Ms. Crumley regarding this incident, it is believed that an unknown party had possession of an old phone 
which was unlocked that had been stolen prior to this event. Ms. Crumley also showed police where the name of her Google 
account, as well as her Starbucks app was changed to a Savvian Lemay. Police were also showed that her Google account had a
new bank card on it which did not belong to Ms. Crumley. At the current time police were unable to identify if this new name on 
the account was an actual name. Police were also unable to verify that this party was indeed the party in possession of the new 
phone. 

Police informed Ms. Crumley of steps to take to help better secure her online accounts. Police also informed Ms. Crumley that she
would need to contact the credit reporting agencies to inform them of the fraud which had taken place. 

At the current time police do not have any suspect information regarding this incident.

4868 Hixson Pike21-123648 11/18/2021   1:12:00AM 91Z Field Interview

On 11/18/2021  at 01:12 hours, Officer Allison #237 and PO Cook #1137 initiated contact with a Suspicious Party in the parking lot 
of the Krystal at 4868 Hixson Pike. During the course of patrol, Officers observed a party sleeping behind a parked truck in the 
parking lot of the business. Officers made contact with the party, later identified as Paul Terry. Mr. Terry stated he was homeless 
in the area and knew some of the Krystal Staff who had told him he could sleep there. Mr. Terry had no warrants and due to no 
complaints being received from the business, was release from the scene by Officers. Nothing further to report.

1330 E 3rd St21-123651 11/18/2021   1:36:00AM 23C Shoplifting

On 11/18/2021  at 01:40 hours, Officer Adam Krystaponis (75508) responded to a Shoplifting at 1330 E 3rd St. 

Upon arrival, I spoke with Ms. Shannon bracket who informed me that a regular customer came into the speedway and went to 
the beer cooler for some beer. Ms. Bracket stated that while she was gathering the beer that this customer said that he would 
carry the two 18 packs of bud light to the counter for her while she got the other one for him.

I asked Ms. Bracket for a description of this customer and she informed me that he was maybe 5'6, glasses, a brown jacket, and 
blue work pants. I then asked for a direction of travel that he may have went and she stated that she did not know for sure.

After closing out the call Ms. Bracket called back in with more information and informed me that the suspect that took the beer 
was a regular named Charlie Brown. 

I followed up with the manager at the speedway and reviewed the camera footage of the shoplifting occurrence. The unknown 
party came in with a mask on and never made eye contact with the cameras. He got the beer and left taking a right out of the 
store to the end of the parking lot entering a dark colored SUV with a spare tire holder on the back. I was unable to get a make or 
tag from the footage.

Based upon Mr. Brown’s history of stealing from this speedway I believe the unknown party to be Charles E Brown III, but I have 
insufficient evidence to take this court.

At this time, there is nothing further to report

1920 Hamill Rd21-123653 11/18/2021   1:40:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information



11/14/2021  12:00:50AM TO 11/20/2021  11:59:50PM

On 11/18/2021  at 01:50 hours, Officer CREIGHTON, TREVOR (73490) reported a memo at 1920 Hamill Road (Hampton Inn).

Once on scene police located a Mr. Carmello Cardella who was clearly intoxicated and stating he was staying at the above stated
hotel but was unsure of what room. At this point Mr. Cardella stated his boss was a Dwayne party and hotel staff was able to pull 
up a room number of 210. At this time police made contact with Mr. Cardella's boss in room 210 and he was able to take Mr. 
Cardella back to his room.

Nothing further to report.

2247 Wilcox Blvd21-123665 11/18/2021   2:37:00AM 91Z Field Interview

On 11/18/2021  at 02:37 hours, Officer Park (86057) reported a memo at 2247 Wilcox Blvd. Upon arrival, I got out with Mr. Eddie 
Bonner. Mr. Bonner was asleep on the sidewalk. Upon approach, I woke Mr. Bonner up. I asked him where he was staying. Mr. 
Bonner stated he was staying with his sister, off Cromwell Rd. I gave Mr. Bonner a ride to his sister's House off of Cromwell Rd.

1119 Norfolk Green Cir21-123721 11/18/2021   8:53:00AM 26A False Pretenses/Swindle/Confidenc

On 11/18/2021  at 08:52 hours, Officer C. Glenn (60757) responded by telephone to a False Pretenses/Swindle/Confidence Game 
at 1119 Norfolk Green Cir.   Mr. Schani says on 11/12/2021, he received a letter from Simply Fast Loans, Inc. dated 11/06/2021.  
He says  the letter is addressed to him and is a past due notice.  He says he contacted Simply Fast Loans and they verified his 
social security number and driver license number.  He says they have sent him a 6 page form to complete and attach a copy of 
the police report. in order  to clear up this matter.   He says he is contacting the credit bureaus to freeze his credit and has already
reviewed the website identitytheft.gov.

2020 Gunbarrel Rd21-123724 11/18/2021   9:00:00AM 23C Shoplifting

On 11/18/2021  at 09:30 hours, Officer Layne, Dakota (77578) responded to a Shoplifting at 2020 Gunbarrel Rd. Upon arrival 
police spoke with Ms. Stargal with Walmart loss prevention, she stated a male and a woman entered the store and selected 
multiple items. Ms. Stargal stated they went to the self-checkout and scanned multiple items but did not pay for a chicken 
sandwich. Ms. Stargal stated she attempted to stop them after they passed all points of sale, but they would not cooperate with 
loss prevention personal. Mr. Stargal stated both of the suspects have been seen shoplifting in Walmart in the last couple of 
weeks and going through vehicles in the parking lot, but always leave before the police arrive. Attached is a photo of the male 
suspect. Nothing further to report.

1704 E 14th St21-123726 11/18/2021  12:01:00AM 23G Theft of Vehicle Parts/Accessories

On 11/18/2021  at 09:18 hours, PT C. Glenn (60757) responded by telephone to a Theft of Vehicle Parts/Accessories at 1704 E 
14th St.   Mr. Houston says sometime between midnight and 0700 this morning an unknown party stole TN  from his 
1989 Chevrolet Caprice.  He says the vehicle was parked on the side of the street in front of his residence.  

NCIC# P477660184.

600 Market St21-123727 11/18/2021   9:20:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 11/18/2021  at 09:20 hours, I, Officer D. Schuerger #805 was flagged down by Brian Macvitie at 600 Market Street, 
Chattanooga.

When I was flagged down, Mr. Macvitie stated that Tammy McGill stole his special coin. He stated that he let her look at it and she
wouldn't give it back. Then I spoke with Ms. McGill who stated that Mr. Macvitie gave the coin to her as a gift. I asked her if she 
would give it back to him because he wanted it back and she stated that she would. At which point, Ms. McGill pulled out the coin 
and gave it to me. Then I gave it to Mr. Macvitie and both parties went on their way.

Officer Schuerger #805



11/14/2021  12:00:50AM TO 11/20/2021  11:59:50PM

103 Jordan Dr21-123735 11/18/2021   9:46:00AM 23G Theft of Vehicle Parts/Accessories

On 11/18/2021  at 09:34 hours, PT C. Glenn (60757) responded by telephone to a Theft of Vehicle Parts/Accessories at 103 
Jordan Dr.  I spoke with Mercedes Owens of Community Options.  She says at an unknown time, an unknown party stole TN tag 

off of a company leased 2019 Subaru.

NCIC# P307680645

3131 Mountain Creek Rd21-123741 11/18/2021  10:15:00AM 26B Credit Card/ATM Fraud

On 11/18/2021  at 10:01  hours, PT C. Glenn (60757) responded by telephone to a Credit Card/ATM Fraud at 3131  Mountain Creek 
Rd.  Mrs. Ward says that over 2 days ago, her Facebook account was hacked and captured.  She says her Whatsapp and 
Cashapp are both connected to her Facebook account.  She says that an unknown party was using her Cashapp to make 
deposits and purchase bit coins with those deposits and has taken $1200.00 of her money.  She says that she had been sending 
explicit pictures of herself using Facebook messenger and Whatsapp to her husband and the unknown has been posting those 
pictures on her facebook.  She says she used her husband's facebook to contact the unknown.  She says the unknown has a very
thick Asian Indian accent and was very difficult to understand.  She says he told her he would give her Facebook back to her for 
$100.00.

701 Market St21-123757 11/17/2021   3:30:00PM 91Z Property Lost

On 11/18/2021  at 10:52 hours, PT C. Glenn (60757) responded by telephone to a Property Lost at 701  Market St.  Ms. Hughes 
says yesterday about 1530 hours she sat on a bench outside of First Horizon Bank.  She says when she got up, she must have 
left her wallet laying on the bench.  She says she is in the process of canceling all of the debit and debit cards that were in her 
wallet.

223 Carriage Parc Dr21-123778 11/16/2021   8:00:00PM 91Z Property Lost

On 11/18/2021  at 11:49 hours, PT C. Glenn (60757) responded by telephone to a Property Lost at 223 Carriage Parc Dr.   Mr. 
Davis says Tuesday evening around 200 hours he lost his wallet in the vicinity of his apartment.

4815 Highway 5821-123795 11/18/2021   1:00:00PM 91Z Property Found

On 11/18/2021  at 13:01  hours, Officer A. Roebuck (86060) responded to a Property Found at 4815 Highway 58. A small black 
purse was found in the parking lot at this location. It contained the Georgia ID of a one Emma Kernea. I was unable to locate or 
make contact with Kernea. The purse was turned in to the property section. Nothing further.

2009 Tournament Dr21-123798 11/17/2021   7:00:00PM 23D Theft from Building

On 11/18/2021  at 12:35 hours, Officer Wiegand (84865) responded to a Theft from Building at 2009 Tournament dr. Police spoke 
with complainant Robert Townsend an employee of victim DR Horton. Mr. Townsend stated the finishing crew leaves the job site 
around 1900 and people start arriving at 0800. Sometime in between suspects entered the unlocked garage and stole three 150ft 
extension cords ($300), a Drummond sump pump ($100), and a 24ft extension ladder ($200). This is the second time items have 
been stolen from this site. There is no suspect information at this time. Police placed the site on the watch list until they can get 
cameras installed.



11/14/2021  12:00:50AM TO 11/20/2021  11:59:50PM

 
 

7701 Lee Hwy21-123854 11/18/2021   3:58:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 11/18/2021  at 16:04 hours, Officer S. Long (79892) reported a memo at 7701  Lee Hwy. Upon arrival, I spoke with the manager 
of Mapco, Mr. Bobby Green, who wished to have two parties trespassed who were on the property loitering and causing 
disorders. The two parties are homeless and named Mr. Christopher Neal and Cory Tinker. They both were officially trespassed 
and left without incident. No further.

400 W Martin Luther King Blvd21-123858 11/18/2021   4:14:00PM 91Z Field Interview

On 11/18/2021  at 16:16 hours, Officer D. Bryant (79858) reported a memo at 400 W Martin Luther King Blvd. Police observed a 
vehicle( vehicle #1 Mazda CX-5 (Suspect)) traveling East on Boynton Dr with dark tinted windows. Police attempted to make a 
traffic stop on the vehicle near the above address. The vehicle got onto I-27 SB and fled from police heading West on I-24.

On 11/19/2021  at 12:48 hours, Officer G. Stroud (75386) reported a memo at 400 W Martin Luther King Blvd. Mr. Ballard and his 
brother located the vehicle at 2700 Cowart St. He wanted Police to standby as his brother got into the vehicle and drove it away.

 

 

 

4400 Amnicola Hwy21-123894 11/18/2021   6:14:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 11/18/2021  at 18:20 hours, Officer M. Wilkerson (83698) police responded to a crash at 4400 Amnicola Hwy. Upon arrival 
police spoke with Noah Harris who stated that as he was traveling North on Amnicola Hwy., a dark colored SUV rear ended him 
and continued traveling. Mr. Harris stated that the damage was minimal and due to no suspect information, he did not wish to 
have a crash report made at this time. Mr. Harris stated he would speak with his insurance and make contact with police if further 
was needed. No injuries reported on scene. Nothing further at this time.

314 Mcbrien Rd21-123899 11/18/2021   4:31:00PM 240 MVT/Passenger Vehicle



11/14/2021  12:00:50AM TO 11/20/2021  11:59:50PM

On 11/18/2021  at 17:59 hours, Officer E. Lee (885) responded to a MVT/Passenger Vehicle at 314 Mcbrien Rd. I spoke with the 
complainant Mr. Jaylain Ballard over the phone. Mr. Ballard stated he was driving his girlfriends white Mazda CX-5 (TN . 
Mr. Ballard stated he parked the Mazda at 314 Mcbrien Rd near the "E" building and left the car running while he went inside the 
building. Mr. Ballard stated he returned approximately 30 minutes later to find the vehicle stolen. Mr. Ballard stated he didn't have 
any suspect information at this time. I spoke with the owner of the vehicle Ms. Jerri Christopher, which stated she didn't wish to 
prosecute at this time. I informed Ms. Christopher she could call back in if she wished to prosecute so the vehicle would be put 
into NCIC as stolen. At this time the vehicle will not be placed into NCIC as stolen.

210 W 4th St21-123914 11/18/2021   6:34:00PM 23F Theft from Motor Vehicle

On 11/18/2021  at 19:00 hours, I Officer Goulet #385 responded to a Theft from Motor Vehicle at 210 W 4th St.
Upon arrival, I spoke to the victim James Phillips, he stated that he was walking out to his truck from the gym, when he noticed 
that his passenger side window had been busted. Window damage is worth about $500 to repair. The victim stated that he 
noticed his Springfield .45 handgun had been stolen. The victim stated that his gun had a stream light laser on it and the total of 
the gun would be about $500.  The victim stated that he placed it on the driver's side of the center council, placed in a 
compartment next to his leg. I then called NCIC and had them place the firearm as stolen NIC # G375465779. I checked for 
cameras, all of them were facing away from the victim's truck. 

Nothing further to report at this time.

4011 Brainerd Rd21-123961 11/18/2021  10:20:00PM 91Z Property Found

On 11/19/2021  at 09:11  hours, Officer Branam (70776) wrote a continuation/supplement for a Property Found at 4011  Brainerd 
Rd.  The owner of the business at this location notified Police that if video footage is needed for the case, he can be reached at 

1604 E 37th St21-123974 11/18/2021  11:01:00PM 91Z Field Interview

On 11/18/2021  at 23:01  hours, Officer Dyess #704 initiated a traffic stop at 1600 E 37th St for a headlight out on a black Kia 
Optima. Police made contact with a Anshella Hutchens who was unaware of the light out. Ms. Hutchens had a valid license and 
Police gave her a warning for the light.

 
 

 
 

5505 Brainerd Rd21-123995 11/19/2021  12:58:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information



11/14/2021  12:00:50AM TO 11/20/2021  11:59:50PM

On the 19th of November 2021 0058, Officer Lynch responded to a suspicious activity call at Motel 6 5505 Brainerd Rd.
Upon arrival, Police spoke to Stephanie Ellison, the manager at the hotel. She told Police that she got a suspicious phone call 
from a male party claiming to be Mr. Patel. This party began asking questions about the fire extinguishers and how much money 
was in the cash register. Ms. Ellison also told Police this party was acting as though they were going to receive a package at this 
address. Ms. Ellison wanted to report the incident because she thought it was highly suspicious. No further.

 

 
 

 
 

 

1204 Gadd Rd21-124005 11/19/2021   2:08:00AM 91Z Field Interview

On 11/19/2021  at 02:08 hours, Officer Allison #237 and PO Cook #1137 initiated at traffic stop at the 1200 Block of Gadd Rd at 
Thomas Ln. During the course of patrol Officers observed BMW 328i traveling north on Hwy 153. Officers observed that the 
vehicles passenger side headlight was not functioning. Officers accelerated to 60 Mph to catch up to the vehicle and paced the 
vehicle going approximately 60 mph in a 45 mph zone. Officers initiated emergency equipment with the vehicle pulling to the right 
the at 1204 Gadd Rd at Thomas Ln. Officers made contact with the driver, Ajaui Brown, who stated his mother had asked him to 
take her car to the gas station for groceries. He stated he was returning to the residence they were staying when he was stopped 
by Police.  He stated he did not have his license on him with Officers later identifying that he had only been issued a state ID.  Mr.
Brown was issued a verbal warning and was released from the scene.

8396 Morin Rd21-124039 11/19/2021   6:20:00AM 91Z Damaged Property Accidental

On 11/19/2021  at 06:40 hours, Officer Joseph Brookshire (86045) responded to a Damaged Property Accidental at 8396 Morin 
Rd. Police arrived on scene and met with a Mr. Watkins. Mr. Watkinds stated that while leaving his house this morning he did not 
let his windshield defrost causing him to strike a tree with the front drivers side of the vehicle. Police gathered his information and 
left the scene. Nothing further to report.

4045 Day Lily Trl21-124102 11/18/2021  11:00:00PM 23F Theft from Motor Vehicle

On 11/19/2021  at 09:37 hours, PT C. Glenn (60757) responded by telephone to a Theft from Motor Vehicle at 4045 Day Lily Trl.  
Mr. Morton says sometime after 2300 hours last evening, an unknown party entered his unlocked 2009 Subaru and stole his 
wallet and its contents.  Mr. Morton says he was unaware of this till a jogger came to his residence with some of the items that 
were in his wallet and returned them to him.

1415 Crawford St21-124110 11/19/2021   5:00:00AM 290 Vandalism

On 11/19/2021  at 10:00 hours, Officer Branam (70776) responded to a Vandalism at 1415 Crawford St. The caller, Anthony 
D'Angelo (General Manager, Watt-N-Storage), stated that last night around 0500hrs, an unknown white male cut a hole through 
his fence and had video footage of this incident.  He stated that once inside the fence, the suspect went straight to Unit 273 and 
gained entry without damaging the lock as if he "picked" the lock.  He also stated that he placed several items outside the unit; 
however, the suspect did not appear to take anything.  The suspect then left in a dark colored sedan in an unknown direction.  
The video footage was consistent with Mr. D'Angelo's statement.  There is no suspect information at this time and the unit owner 
could not be reached by phone.



11/14/2021  12:00:50AM TO 11/20/2021  11:59:50PM

 

 

 

 

 
 

5740 Hwy 15321-124198 11/19/2021   1:50:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 11/19/2021  at 14:10 hours, Officer B. Martin (62436) reported a memo at 5740 Hwy 153. Upon arrival I spoke to both 
operators involved. The complainant stated she wanted a property damage report for her insurance company. 
I was told that the complainant was in the drive through line when a Chick-fil-a employee motioned for vehicle #2 to pull around 
vehicle #1. It appears that a rubber wedge, used to support granite counter tops, rubbed against the rear passenger side corner o
vehicle #1. The rubber wedge transfered a scuff to vehicle #1. There did not appear to be any physical damage to vehicle #2. 
Vehicle #1 did not sustain any damage.

Vehicle #1
TN 
Travelers Ins
3n970073BA
08/28/2021   

Vehicle #2
TN 
Geico Ins
4490366582
11/14/2021

 
 



11/14/2021  12:00:50AM TO 11/20/2021  11:59:50PM

 

3550 Cummings Hwy21-124230 11/19/2021   3:00:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 11/19/2021  at 15:03 hours, Officer B.Smith (061120)  responded to a person down near the entranceway to the Walmart 
Super Store, the police located the homeless man a Mr. David Hargiss, he was found laying on the ground sleeping in the sun.  
EMS responded to the scene and checked Mr. Hargiss medical condition, he was found to be normal. No further treatment was 
needed.

1363 Solar Dr21-124245 11/19/2021   4:59:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 11/19/2021  at 15:45 hours, Officer Simpson (83694) reported a memo at 1363 Solar Dr. Police were dispatched to this 
location for an open door. After clearing the residence, it was determined that no one lived there. There were no signs of squatters
or forced entry. The door was secured and locked.

Carter St//W 10th St21-124274 11/19/2021   4:40:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 11/19/2021  at 16:55 hours, Officer S. Oliver (912) reported a memo at Carter St / W 10th St. Officers were initially dispatched 
to a rear end accident without injuries. Upon arrival, officers located the two involved parties and identified them as a Ms. Tonya 
Miller and a Mr. Abraham Borja. Ms. Miller and Mr. Borja did not have any damage to their vehicles and did not wish to make an 
accident report. Ms. Miller did wish for a miscellaneous report to be filed in case her husband thought there was in fact damage. In
the case Ms. Miller changes her mind, vehicle information was obtained as well as insurance.

Ms. Miller's vehicle: TN /Farm Bureau PN: 8294377
Mr. Borja's vehicle: TN /Farm Bureau PN: AP 8349066

4500 Amnicola Hwy21-124302 11/19/2021   5:49:00PM 91Z Field Interview

On 11/19/2021  at 17:52 hours, I Officer Wilcox #1036 responded to a suspicious person walking in the middle of Amnicola Hwy. 
Upon arrival, I located a female walking in the middle of the street. The female was identified as Elizabeth Lamb. Ms. Lamb stated
she was walking from Bonny Oaks Dr and was homeless, looking for someplace to go. I ran Ms. Lamb through NCIC and found 
that she had a warrant that did not verify per sessions. I transported Ms. Lamb to the Chattanooga Rescue Mission, 1513 N 
Holtzclaw Ave. No further.

736 Cherry St21-124310 11/19/2021   6:05:00PM 91Z Field Interview

On 11/19/2021  at 18:10 hours, Officer Goulet (83684) reported a memo at 736 Cherry St.  Officers were dispatched to a homeless 
male setting up a camp behind the address above. Officers arrived on scene and made contact with the complainant, Brandy 
Chadwick. Ms. Chadwick lead officers to the area where she saw the man setting up camp. Officers observed a white male with a
bucket in the back corner of a patio behind the business. Officers made contact with the homeless party and were able to identify 
him as John Carmichael. Officers instructed Mr. Carmichael that he could not be camping back there and that it was private 
property. Officer ran Mr. Carmichael for warrant with no return. Officers observed Mr. Carmichael leave the area. No further police
action required.

3644 Cummings Hwy21-124346 11/18/2021  10:00:00PM 23G Theft of Vehicle Parts/Accessories



11/14/2021  12:00:50AM TO 11/20/2021  11:59:50PM

On 11/19/2021  at 19:07 hours, Officer Dropp (675) responded by phone to a Theft of Vehicle Parts/Accessories at 3644 
Cummings Hwy. Mr. Nathaniel Burcham stated that he was at the above address from 11/18/2021 2200 hours until 11/19/2021  
1000 hours, with his vehicle parked in the truck parking lot. He stated that when he returned to his vehicle and began driving, he 
observed that the catalytic converter had been removed while he was asleep at the hotel. There is no suspect information at this 
time.

1108 Valentine Cir21-124352 11/19/2021   7:25:00PM 91Z Suspicious Activity

On 11/19/2021  at 19:25 hours, Officer Zachary Lloyd (79530)/E. Roebuck (1128) responded to a suspicious person at 1108 
Valentine Cir. Officers arrived on scene and spoke with the complainant, Ms. Megan Flynn, who stated a man had entered her 
home through the front door (unlocked) and stated he was in the wrong place and then left. Ms. Flynn was unable to provide a 
description of the individual beyond he was a white male. Ms. Flynn further stated he exited the home through the front door and 
left in an unknown direction. Upon further inspection of the home officers were unable to locate anyone in the home or any signs 
of forced entry. Ms. Flynn later stated to officers nothing had been taken from her home. Officers surveyed the area but were 
unable to locate anyone.

330 Frazier Ave21-124359 11/19/2021   8:10:00PM 91Z Property Found

On 11/19/2021  at 20:20 hours, Officer Goulet (83684) responded to a Property Found at 330 Frazier Ave. Officers made contact 
with the complainant, Garret Worley, who stated he found a debit card in the parking meter in the parking lot behind Toto Sushi. 
Officers took the debit card and placed it into property for safe keeping. No further police action taken.

137 Oyler Ln21-124407 11/19/2021  11:28:00PM 91Z Suspicious Activity

On 11/19/2021  at 23:03 hours, Officer E. Rogers (86062) reported a memo at 137 Oyler Ln. I arrived on scene and spoke with 
complainant Nicholas Bailey. Mr. Bailey said his neighbors door had been open for several hours but no one lives in the 
apartment so he did not know why it was open. Police cleared the inside of the apartment. It appeared that maintenance had been
working on it and did not lock the doors before leaving. I was able to lock one of the two doors but could not lock both. Mr. Bailey 
said he had called maintenance and they said they would come lock it later on.

3604 Brainerd Rd21-124412 11/19/2021  11:15:00PM 91Z Field Interview

On 11/19/2021  at 23:24 hours, Officer Gerity, Matthew (78344), and PO Jessen (1144) responded to a disorder with a weapon 
(not shown) at 3604 Brainerd Rd. Upon arrival on scene police spoke with Jasmine Zackery who told police that she was pumping
gas when a woman later identified as Laqualia Crutcher pulled up to another pump. Ms. Zackery told police that as she was 
exiting the gas station Ms. Crutcher approached Ms. Zackery and caused a disorder. Ms. Crutcher approached the vehicle and 
was yelling at Ms. Zackery. Ms. Crutcher informed Ms. Zackery that she had firearms in the vehicle. No physical contact was 
reported, nor was the weapon brandished and Ms. Crutcher left the scene. While police were speaking with Ms. Zackery, Laqualia
Crutcher and Britten Crutcher arrived on scene. Mr and Ms Crutcher told police that similar had happened. Police verified that Ms 
Crutcher's firearms were not stolen. Police were able to get a video of the event and it lined up with what both parties told police. 
Both parties were informed to stay away from the other. Both parties left the scene without incident. No further police action was 
taken at this time.

207 Spears Ave21-124484 11/19/2021  11:00:00PM 240 MVT/Passenger Vehicle

On 11/20/2021  at 07:09 hours, Officer M.Robinson (77583) wrote a continuation/supplement for a MVT/Passenger Vehicle at 207 
Spears Ave. 

A photo of the actual truck is now included in the report.

5106 N Moore Ln21-124512 11/20/2021   9:30:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information



11/14/2021  12:00:50AM TO 11/20/2021  11:59:50PM

On 11/20/2021  at 09:30 hours, Officer Branam (70776) reported a memo at 5106 N Moore Ln.  The caller, Trenace Snow, stated 
that her son (Sharone Tatum) was causing a verbal disorder and she wanted him to leave.  On arrival, Mr. Snow was leaving the 
residence in a beige colored Nissan Altima with his father (Sharone Tatum, Sr).  Ms. Snow stated that she no longer needed 
Police and just wanted him to leave.

 
 

 

708 Mississippi Ave21-124552 11/20/2021   1:00:00AM 23G Theft of Vehicle Parts/Accessories

On 11/20/2021  at 12:46 hours, Officer G. Stroud (75386) responded to a Theft of Vehicle Parts/Accessories at 708 Mississippi 
Ave. Mrs. Rogers started her vehicle this morning and noticed a loud exhaust noise. When she looked under her vehicle she saw 
that her catalyc converter had been cut out of her exhaust and is now stolen. She believes the offense occurred between 
0100-0300hrs this morning. Her residence has been placed on the watch list for 0100-0500 for two weeks. No suspect information
at this time.

641 Kinser Cir21-124554 11/20/2021  12:30:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 11/20/2021  at 12:35 hours, Officer M. Hauge (79528) reported a memo at 641  Kinser Cir. Police made contact with 3 Hispanic 
parties who were intoxicated. from what police could gather the owner of the residence wanted to guest to leave and the guest 
refused. Police told the party her needed to leave and the guest stated he had a ride coming to get him so he waited outside the 
house until his ride came. parties agreed to stay separated until the guests ride came. no further police action needed.

6240 Airpark Dr21-124582 11/20/2021   1:56:00PM 91Z Suspicious Activity

On 11/20/2021  at 13:56 hours, Officer Branam (70776) reported a memo at 6240 Airpark Dr (Extended Stay America).  The 
anonymous caller stated that he was a Lyft driver and that he recently dropped off a customer (later identified as Jason Taylor) at 
this location.  He stated that Mr. Taylor mentioned that he has placed "3 bombs in Chattanooga" and "American is going to war."  
On arrival, I spoke to the front desk clerk of the Extended Stay and she stated that she recently checked in a customer matching 
the description provided by the Lyft driver into room 217.  I relocated to 217 and spoke to Mr. Taylor who appeared to be heavily 
intoxicated.  He stated that he was incredibly drunk and does not recall saying anything about war or explosive devices.   He 
further insured Police that he has no thoughts or has taken no actions to hurt himself or the City of Chattanooga.

2130 Hamilton Place Blvd21-124588 11/20/2021   2:00:00PM 91Z Damaged Property Accidental

On 11/20/2021  at 14:10 hours, Officer Layne, Dakota (77578) responded to a Damaged Property Accidental at 2130 Hamilton 
Place Blvd. Upon arrival police spoke with Ms. Mickel she stated she was in the driver seat of her car when she felt a jolt to her 
vehicle and believed the vehicle was struck by another vehicle. Ms. Michel looked out her window and noticed a vehicle with the 
door open touching her vehicle. Police spoke with Ms. Lovell, she stated she has leg issues and was attempted to get into the 
vehicle when the door struck Ms. Mickels vehicle. Ms. Michel's vehicle sustained damage to the driver-side rear door. Nothing 
further to report.

1227 E Main St21-124594 11/20/2021   2:15:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information



11/14/2021  12:00:50AM TO 11/20/2021  11:59:50PM

On 11/20/2021  at 14:30 hours, Officer Ampthor (73492) reported a memo at 1227 E Main St. Police spoke with Ms. Amanda 
Neeley who was unhappy she had been asked to leave the property after getting into it with another customer.  The other 
customer wink at Ms. Neeley as she exited the bathroom.  Ms. Neeley call the man out on it which led to a verbal argument 
between them and the employee.  The employee, Ms. Chalanda Simmons asked Ms. Neeley to leave to avoid further disorder.  
Ms. Neeley felt wronged for being asked to leave when she was defending herself.  Ms. Simmons wished to have Ms Neeley 
trespassed from the property.  No further.

1800 Mccallie Ave21-124664 11/20/2021   5:00:00PM 91Z Field Interview

On 11/20/2021  at 17:00 hours, Officer M. Pearson (84858) reported a memo at 1800 Mccallie Ave. Police ran the VA tag on 
vehicle #1 Ford Fusion and found that the tag is entered into NCIC as stolen. Police performed a traffic stop on the vehicle and 
made contact with the driver Casey Robinson. Police found that the front license plate had been stolen which matches the rear 
tag. Police confirmed Mr. Robinson as the owner of the vehicle. Nothing further.

2100 Hamilton Place Blvd21-124687 11/20/2021   4:30:00PM 23F Theft from Motor Vehicle

On 11/20/2021  at 18:30 hours, Officer S. Prinzo (86058) responded to a Theft from Motor Vehicle at 2100 Hamilton Place Blvd. 
Officers called Mrs. Ashley Brown who stated her tag was stolen while she was inside the mall around 14:30 hours. Mrs. Brown 
stated the tag was TN . The tag was entered into NCIC on this date (NIC#P627673586). No further.

432 Northmont Rd21-124728 11/20/2021   8:45:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 11/20/2021  at 20:55 hours, Officer Simpson (83694) reported a memo at 432 Northmont Rd. Mr. Parker was upset that Ms. 
Evans kicked him out of the house and was causing a verbal disorder. Mr. Parker left the scene and went to his mother's house 
without incident.

 

2200 E 12th St21-125235 11/20/2021  10:00:00PM 290 Vandalism

On 11/22/2021  at 12:09 hours,  PT McMahan (61444) responded to a Vandalism by calling the victim at 2200 E 12th St at a 
residence.  The victim said he left his vehicle parked on the side of street there overnight last Saturday night.  He last saw it 
around 10:30 pm when he parked it there and when he got back there around 3 or 4 pm the next day on Sunday, he discovered 
some damage on it on the driver side. He said the side mirror had been broken off and there were pieces of it scattered up the 
road (from the mirror) like someone had knocked it off.  He said he suspects another vehicle caused it but he has no idea how the
damage was done for sure. He said there were also scratches/scuff marks on the quarterpanel but no real dents. He said he was 
actually parked on S Kelly St but it was nearest the above location.  He said there have been no estimates yet and the vehicle is 
actually registered to his Mother (Holly Fox).




